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Awarded scholarships to 220 pupils and students in difficult circumstances
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On the morning of December 10 at the City Youth Cultural House. In Ho Chi Minh City, a warm
atmosphere enveloped the 2024 Vu A Dinh Scholarship Awarding Ceremony for 220 students with difficult
circumstances studying in the City.

Uncle Truong My Hoa awarded scholarships to ethnic and island students who overcame difficulties
and studied well

Gain more confidence
The ceremony gathered a large number of delegates, sponsor representatives, teachers,
parents and especially the bright faces of ethnic students in difficult circumstances and studious
at the schools. Primary, middle and high schools in the city. Ho Chi Minh, University Preparatory
School, student of National University of Ho Chi Minh City. Ho Chi Minh City, Ho Chi Minh City
University of Physical Education and Sports, Vietnamese Youth Students - Southern Branch; 60
students are children of National Defense officers and employees of the Ho Chi Minh City
Border Guard and 38 scholarships from the Embrace of Kindness Program for students
severely affected by the Covid pandemic -19.

Ms. Isabelle Muller (Writer, Founder of LOAN STIFTUNG Fund, main sponsor) said: "This year
the Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund celebrates its 25th anniversary, and our LOAN fund also
celebrates its 8th anniversary. established last May. Since 2018, our two funds have cooperated



very successfully and harmoniously with each other. We have the same common goal of helping
children in difficult areas have better living and learning conditions. Today, LOAN Fund will
award 250 scholarships to children from ethnic minority areas and children of border guards.
Hopefully these contributions will give them more motivation to help them overcome difficulties
in life to have a more open future."

The Vu A Dinh scholarship has truly been a source of encouragement and support for students
to have more confidence and motivation in study and life. Most of the students, especially
pupils, students, and families, work in the fields or work as hired laborers, and belong to poor
and extremely difficult households.

Among them, Lam Nhan (Class 9/2, Long Binh Secondary School, Thu Duc City, Ho Chi Minh
City) has been an excellent student for many years, actively participating in Team work; My
father passed away when I was young, my family is near poor, my mother is the main worker,
her job is unstable: maid, dishwasher, restaurant assistant.

Or A Ri Fin (Grade 9, Suong Nguyet Anh Secondary School, District 8, Ho Chi Minh City): An
excellent student, participating in competitions in the Natural Sciences subject, Informatics
team, and Commander Good Team District 8. A Ri Fin's family is very difficult, his father left
when he was young, his mother works as a hired laborer to raise the children and his
grandmother is old and sick.

Mr. Jonathan Hanh Nguyen donated 2 billion VND to support children in difficult circumstances



Student Neáng Chanh Tha (An Giang University, Ho Chi Minh City National University), a
representative of students, had emotional shares: "Today, when standing here, I would like to I
am allowed to represent my family and my fellow students to send my sincerest and deepest
thanks to the ladies and gentlemen of the Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund and the Club "For Hoang
Sa - Truong Sa". ", sponsors for their support In particular, to help us overcome difficulties in
learning. The amount of money I received is truly meaningful to me, because it is not only
material support but also a great source of encouragement for me to continue my learning
journey and conquer my dream."

Valuable companionship
Ms. Truong My Hoa, President of Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund, Head of the "For Beloved Hoang
Sa - Truong Sa" Club said: "In 25 years of operation, the Fund has awarded over 125,000
scholarships to ethnic minority students and students from coastal and island areas. In the
2024-2025 school year, the socio-economic situation is still facing many difficulties. Vu A Dinh
Scholarship Fund continues to mobilize units and philanthropists to persevere and accompany
the Fund, striving to achieve the target of granting 3,000 Vu A Dinh scholarships and 2,500 club
scholarships.

From the beginning of the 2024-2025 school year up to now, Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund and
the Club "For Beloved Hoang Sa - Truong Sa" have directly gone and transferred money to 10
provinces and cities, 5 military units, 4 university units across the country, awarded 670 Vu A
Dinh Scholarships and 244 Club scholarships. All thanks to the trust and companionship of
benefactors. In addition, the efforts of students after receiving scholarships are a source of
encouragement for benefactors and businesses to continue joining hands with Vu A Dinh
Scholarship Fund in the cause of developing young human resources".



Ms. Truong My Hoa awarded scholarships to ethnic minority students and students from coastal
and island areas who overcame difficulties and studied well.

Ms. Isabelle Muller (Writer, Founder of LOAN STIFTUNG Foundation, the main sponsor) said:
<This year, Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund celebrates its 25th anniversary, and our LOAN
Foundation also celebrated its 8th anniversary last May. Since 2018, our two foundations have
cooperated very successfully and well. We have the same goal of helping children in
disadvantaged areas have better living and learning conditions. Today, LOAN Foundation will
award 250 scholarships to ethnic minority children and children of border guards. Hopefully,
these contributions will give them more motivation to overcome difficulties in life to have a
brighter future=.

The Vu A Dinh scholarship has truly been a source of encouragement and support for children
to have more confidence and motivation in studying and living. Most of the students, especially
students, have families that are farmers or hired workers, and are poor or in extremely difficult
circumstances.

Among them is Lam Nhan (Grade 9/2, Long Binh Secondary School, Thu Duc City, Ho Chi Minh
City), who has been an excellent student for many years, actively participating in the work of the
Youth Union; His father passed away when he was young, his family is near-poor, his mother is
the main laborer, with an unstable job: housekeeping, dishwashing, and restaurant assistant.



Or A Ri Fin (Grade 9, Suong Nguyet Anh Secondary School, District 8, Ho Chi Minh City): An
excellent student, participating in competitions in the Natural Science subject, the Informatics
team, and Commander of the District 8 Excellent Team. A Ri Fin's family is very difficult, his
father left when he was young, his mother works for hire to raise him, and his grandmother is
old and weak, often sick.

Mr. Jonathan Hanh Nguyen donated 2 billion VND to support children in difficult circumstances.

Student Neang Chanh Tha (An Giang University, Ho Chi Minh City National University),
representing the students, shared his emotional thoughts: <Today, standing here, I would like to
represent my family and students to express my sincere and deepest thanks to the ladies and
gentlemen of the Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund and the <For Hoang Sa - Truong Sa Beloved=
Club, and the sponsors for their special attention and support, helping us overcome difficulties in
our studies. The amount of money received is truly meaningful to me, because it is not only
material support but also a great source of encouragement for me to continue my journey of
studying and conquering my dreams=.

Valuable companionship
Ms. Truong My Hoa, President of Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund, Head of the "For Beloved Hoang
Sa - Truong Sa" Club said: "In 25 years of operation, the Fund has awarded over 125,000
scholarships to ethnic minority students and students from coastal and island areas. In the
2024-2025 school year, the socio-economic situation is still facing many difficulties. Vu A Dinh
Scholarship Fund continues to mobilize units and philanthropists to persevere and accompany



the Fund, striving to achieve the target of granting 3,000 Vu A Dinh scholarships and 2,500 club
scholarships.

From the beginning of the 2024-2025 school year up to now, Vu A Dinh Scholarship Fund and
the "For Beloved Hoang Sa - Truong Sa" Club have directly gone and transferred money to 10
provinces and cities, 5 military units, 4 university units across the country, awarded 670 Vu A
Dinh Scholarships and 244 Club scholarships. All thanks to the trust and companionship of
benefactors. In addition, the efforts of students after receiving scholarships are a source of
encouragement for benefactors and businesses to continue joining hands with Vu A Dinh
Scholarship Fund in the cause of developing young human resources".

Ms. Truong My Hoa shares about the fund's achievements over the past 25 years and vision for the
future.

Moved by the plight of the students and the persistence of the Vu A Dinh Fund in caring for
them, Mr. Jonathan Hanh Nguyen, Chairman of the Board of Directors of Lien Thai Binh Duong
Import-Export Company Limited, decided to immediately donate 2 billion VND (from personal
money and the company's fund) to support the Fund to continue its journey of supporting the
young generation. He shared: "As long as I am breathing, I will continue to accompany the Fund
to share and help the children. We help because they are the seeds of the future generation.
When receiving scholarships, the children have more confidence to try to study, to strive to
become useful people like the Vu A Dinh Fund has now had children who have grown up and



become doctors, engineers, teachers, and scientists. Thus, the contributions of the benefactors
are more meaningful and practical".

The scholarship awarding ceremony ended in a warm and meaningful atmosphere. The
scholarships (VND 1,000,000/scholarship for students and VND 1,500,000/scholarship for
university students) are not only material support but also a great source of spiritual
encouragement, helping students overcome difficulties and rise up in life.


